Troy School District
BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

CO.: Park Athletic Supply
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Dimmer Warren
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.:Nabozneys

TERMS:

CO.: BSN Sports
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Tri County Custom Sports
TERMS: Net 30

FIRM: 6 Months FIRM: 60 Days FIRM: 180 Days FIRM: 3654 on all orders 05-28004 UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 60 Days except where noted
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL PRICE COST UNIT TOTAL
QTY DESCRIPTION Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST
ATHENS - BOYS BASKETBALL
12 Spaulding TF 1000 Basketballs 34.89 418.68 28.20 338.40 34.25 411.00 Spalding #LBTF10000WC 30.06 360.72 29.50 354.00
3 Pearless Whistles with lanyard 7.99 23.97 [#C-623 3.50 10.50 Fox 40 4.25 12.75 |Acme Paat2000 Dz @ $23.59 25.91 2591 6.75 20.25
Lanyard MSLNYDK dz @2.32 sold in dz only
2 Slipp Nott refill pads 44.89 89.78 [40/pk 19.50 39.00 Trac Mule 41.50 83.00 NO BID 31.50 63.00
12 Jump Ropes 2.89 34.68 [Pro9' $2.50 ea=$30.00 Speed 9' 175 21.00 JRH 3.50 42.00 |8" #1040166 0.52 6.24 2.50 30.00
15 Red/White practice jerseys Plain 9.08 136.20 |TW1424 No Lettering 9.85 1471.75 Alleson 599ZP 8.10 121.50 Pro-Down - no #'s 4.96 74.40 [Alleson No lettering 10.50 157.50
12 Nets Champ NG03 2.89 34.68 [Carron NGN $4.50 ea. = $54.00 100% Nylon 2.50 30.00 Garel 2.50 30.00 MacGregor SNBBN90X4 0.56 6.72 TBN102-N 5.25 63.00
1 Tri-pod NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 75.00 75.00
16 Speedline Collegiate 0182-31 White Jersey with Scarlet trim and NO BID NO BID 114.00 1,824.00 NO BID |If ordered by May 13 58.50 936.00
lettering; "ATHENS" on front with number. Back will have 8" number. May 14 to June 10 - $61.50 = $984.00
Sizes & #: 5 size 44 - #510,12,14,20,22; After June 11 - $68.75 = $1,031.25
8 size 46 - #'s 24,30,32,34,40,44,53:
2 size 48 - #'s 50,52; and 1 size 50 - #54
16 Collegiate 0577J-31 White short w/Red leg insert & #. 4-34's, 6-36's NO BID NO BID 130.00 2,080.00 NO BID |If ordered by May 13 64.50 1,032.00
and 2-40's 5-14 to 6-10 - $68.50 = $1,096.00
ATHENS - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL 737.99 586.65 4,604.25 473.99 |after 6-11 - $73.50 = $1,176.00 2,730.75
ATHENS - WRESTLING
20 E-41 Traditional Head Gear - Scarlet 20.19 403.80 16.50 330.00 15.50 310.00 Cliff Keen 6490XXXX 18.46 369.20 18.50 370.00
2 KBMR5 Replacement pads for bucketless mop (5 per package) NO BID 64.50 129.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 SB-7 Cliff Keen Scorebook 5.99 17.97 4.95 14.85 5.00 15.00 NO BID 6.00 18.00
12 PL-1950 Life line power jump ropes NO BID Pro #900 350 42.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 L74CC86J Keen Sheen Lycra Singlet. Vegas Gold w/leg top & 59.89 1,796.70 52.40 1,572.00 39.50 1,185.00 NO BID 56.50 1,695.00
bottom trim in Red, leg middle trim in black. Arm & Neck trim in Red.
1-1/2" "TROY" with "ATHENS" below screened in Old English style
on center front in Red with Black outline. 1/2" "RED" with "HAWKS"
below screened in Old English style on Upper Back in Red with Black
outline. Sizes: 4-Small, 12-Medium, 7-Lg, 4-XL, 2-XXL, 1-XXXL
ATHENS - WRESTLING TOTAL 2,218.47 2,087.85 1,510.00 369.20 2,083.00
ATHENS - VOLLEYBALL
6 Wilson Gold AVP Leather - outdoor volleyballs Tachi SVSWO 35.95 215.70 41.75 250.50 45.75 27450 NO BID NO BID
2 Park & Sun Spectrum Flex Set (TS-FLEX) outdoor net system Excel E6470 345.00 690.00 269.00 538.00 NO BID 82.42 164.84 NO BID
16 Kaepa Spectrum tear away sweat pants - Red; Sizes: 6 med, 10-Lg NO BID 28.50 456.00 27.50 440.00 24.06 384.96 NO BID
16 Asics Damsel warm-up sweat pants - Red; Sizes 3 small, 3 medium, NO BID 24.50 392.00 24.95 399.20 NO BID 27.00 432.00
10 large
16 Asics Chico duffle bag - Red NO BID 19.75 316.00 18.75 300.00 MacGregor 24"Lx12"Wx10"H #1048773 8.12 129.92 plain 23.00 368.00
2 [sets |Volleyball Antennas Excel 6484 54.95 109.90 68.50 137.00 Martin 24.00 48.00 Mcgregor 18.42 36.84 NO BID
1 Net Extender - USAV Training Device NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Skymeter - vertical jump marker NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 |box |Sport-X spot markers SPX12 Korney hox =1t 45.00 45.00 33.50 33.50 NO BID NO BID
2 Videos - (1) Drills For Defense & Passing (By Russ Ross (2) Essential NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Troy School District
BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

CO.: Park Athletic Supply
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Dimmer Warren
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.:Nabozneys
TERMS:

CO.: BSN Sports
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Tri County Custom Sports
TERMS: Net 30

FIRM: 6 Months FIRM: 60 Days FIRM: 180 Days FIRM: 3654 on all orders 05-28004 UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 60 Days except where noted
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL PRICE COST UNIT TOTAL
QTY DESCRIPTION Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST
Drills For Blocking (By Debbie Brown)
ATHENS - VOLLEYBALL CONTINUED
1 Digital Scout Softwear NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ATHENS - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 1,060.60 2,123.00 1,461.70 716.56 800.00
TROY HIGH - VOLLEYBALL
14 Black Mizuno Training Jacket with TROY" embroidered in white on 41.95 587.30 39.40 551.60 37.00 518.00 NO BID 37.50 525.00
left front. Sizes: 3 Small, 8 med, 3 Lg
14 Black Mizuno Training Pants with TROY" embroidered in white on front 39.95 559.30 37.20 520.80 33.75 47250 NO BID 37.50 525.00
left thigh. Sizes: 6 Med, 4 Lg, 4 Xtr Long Lg
17 National Il White/Black Mizuno Jersey 4" # on front left chest, 3" 42.95 730.15 41.50 705.50 38.00 646.00 NO BID |1- color print 45.00 765.00
Screened "TROY" on back with 8" # below. Sizes & Numbers:
6 Small (#'s 1-6), 9 Med. #'s 7-14 (with 2 #12s), 2 Lg # 15 & 16
1 National Il Black/White Mizuno Jersey to match existing. 4" white #1¢ 42.95 42.95 [This item must be purchased with above item 44.50 44.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
screened on left chest. 3" "TROY" on back with 8" #16 below.
Size: Medium
6 Mizuno Style 360010 Black Carry All Duffle NEO size: 26"Lx13"Wx 34.95 209.70 37.50 225.00 30.00 180.00 NO BID 35.50 213.00
13"H
15 Baden 15-OC red, black, white practice balls 52.00 780.00 38.40 576.00 34.50 517.50 Tachikara #1072266 25.16 377.40 40.25 603.75
8 Tachikara SV5W Gold game volleyballs 48.95 391.60 35.40 283.20 37.00 296.00 Tachikara. 37.96 303.68 38.50 308.00
1 Ball Cart 85.00 85.00 74.50 74.50 65.00 65.00 McGregor 22.42 22.42 Baden 115.00 115.00
TROY HIGH - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 3,386.00 2,981.10 2,695.00 703.50 3,054.75
TROY HIGH - BOYS BASKETBALL
2 |pkgs |KBA Black dry erase pens K-450 8.00 16.00 6.50 13.00 CBPO 2.25 4.50 3.67 7.34 8.50 17.00
2 |pkgs |KBA Black dry erase pens K-451 10.00 20.00 7.50 15.00 CBPO 225 4.50 NO BID 8.50 17.00
3 Coach double Folders (CDF-1) 24.00 72.00 [Korney Boards as wanted 21.20 63.60 NO BID NO BID 23.00 69.00
3 Mark V scorebooks 7.99 23.97 4.40 13.20 6.00 18.00 3.94 11.82 4.50 13.50
12 Spalding Top Flite Mens Wide Channel Basketballs 34.89 418.68 28.20 338.40 TF1000 34.25 411.00 Spalding 30.06 360.72 29.50 354.00
1 Super Wide Track Ball Rack (Korney 2000) 155.00 155.00 |#BRC4 $75.00ea  K-2000 125.00 125.00 NO BID NO BID 138.00 138.00
15 Russell M30 Shooting Shirt - White with silver/gray side/undersleeve  [M30 is a uniform not a warmup NO BID 59.90 898.50 57.00 855.00 NO BID M3073CS 62.50 937.50
panel and neck and black piping stripe neck and braid bordering.
2 color screened interlocking TC on front center Black Sizes: 6 Ig, 9 XL
15 Russell M30 Tearway pant - White with silver/gray side panel and M30 is a uniform not a warmup NO BID 76.40 1,146.00 73.00 1,095.00 NO BID M3073GR 82.50 1,237.50
black braid bordering. Sizes: 6 large, 9 XL
2 Blocking Shields ASI BSC3 43.49 86.98 34.75 69.50 Fisher HD100 27.95 55.90 5"x18"x28" Pro-Down #200232811 - Blue 15.84 31.68 NO BID
15 Black/White reversible scrimmage jerseys with numbers 1-15 screened 12.49 187.35 Nylon Mesh TR1424 13.20 198.00 Alleson 590ZP 10.95 164.25 #'s on back only 10.56 158.40 Alleson 17.00 255.00
on both backs
15 Black scrimmage shorts plain 8.99 134.85 Nylon Mesh TW4423 9.75 146.25 599zP 8.50 127.50 #C98 7.68 115.20 Alleson 10.50 157.50
TROY HIGH - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL 1,114.83 3,026.45 2,735.65 685.16 3,196.00
TROY HIGH - GYMNASTICS
1 Chalk Holder (AAI #407012) 185.00 185.00 172.00 172.00 167.00 167.00 NO BID NO BID
4 Hook & Jaw Turnbuckles (AAI 420735) 47.00 188.00 45.90 183.60 44.00 176.00 NO BID NO BID
1 Snap Lock for AMF/AAI (AAI 9700050) 25.00 25.00 19.95 19.95 19.00 19.00 NO BID NO BID




Troy School District
BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

CO.: Park Athletic Supply
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Dimmer Warren
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.:Nabozneys
TERMS:

CO.: BSN Sports
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Tri County Custom Sports

TERMS: Net 30

FIRM: 6 Months FIRM: 60 Days FIRM: 180 Days FIRM: 3654 on all orders 05-28004 UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 60 Days except where noted
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL PRICE COST UNIT TOTAL
QTY DESCRIPTION Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST
10 |lbs  |Chalk 15.00/lb 15.00 150.00 8.2 0z. blocks 8.50 85.00 85.00 850.00 3.06 30.60 NO BID
TROY HIGH - GYMNASTICS CONTINUED
18 Black gymnastic bag with white trim Mizmo black 34.95 629.10 |#CB10 20"x12"x12" black only w/shoulder strap 8.95 161.10 NO BID NO BID |22 X 13 X13 PreGame 27.50 495.00
TROY HIGH - GYMNASTICS TOTAL 1,177.10 621.65 1,212.00 30.60 495.00
TROY HIGH WRESTLING
40 Knee pads - sizes: 8 small, 12 med, 12 Ig, 8 X-Lg, (not black inside) CK red or navy BK64 6.89 275.60 |Black/Royal #42 Matman 8.70 348.00 LK69 14.25 570.00 min. order of 12 12.98 519.20 |Blac/Kelly gre Cliff Keen 17.00 680.00
12 Quad Tech Brute ear guard black with grey 0235 17.49 209.88 14.20 170.40 19.25 231.00 min order of 10 16.63 199.56 18.00 216.00
72 Brute 012345 Viper Singlet (see attached for specifications) 1 XS, 11 with one color one locat 54.95 3,956.40 39.07 2,813.04 45.95 3,308.40 NO BID |assuming 1-color print in 2 locations 51.50 3,708.00
small, 23 med, 231g, 10 XL, 3 XXL 1 XXXL logo 1XXXL 45.00 45.00
2 |cases |4" Mat Tape 23/case 119.19 238.38 115.40 230.80 102.00 204.00 #6406XXXX 89.76 179.52 155.00 310.00
6 MT3 Mat Transporter 21.5" x 26" to handle mat sections up to 14' wide 104.89 629.34 84.50 507.00 88.00 528.00 Alt 6425XXXX 94.16 564.96 107.50 645.00
1 Face Mask CK F63 48.89 48.89 |Keen #FG3 41.75 4175 63 34.50 34.50 NO BID 44.50 4450
6 [sets |Ankle bands (green and red) vinyl - pr. 3.89 23.34 |Keen 6.95 41.70 3.25 19.50 NO BID 7.50 45.00
2 KBM Kennedy bucketless mops NO BID |with 1 quart cleaner 121.50 243.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 |pkgs |KBMR5 Replacement pads (pkg) NO BID 59.50 119.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 K72 6' The Monster Mop NO BID 245.00 245.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 Holloway Flagship Jacket Black/Scarlet White lettering TC Wrestling on 44.95 1,618.20 37.90 1,364.40 50.25 1,809.00 NO BID |#9043 50.50 1,818.00
front, Troy on back. Sizes and #'s 6 small (#1-6), 12 med (#7-18),
12 large (#19-30), 6XL (#30-35)
36 Holloway Jogger Pant Black plain 24.95 898.20 21.20 763.20 2450 882.00 NO BID |#9041 24.75 891.00
TROY HIGH - WRESTLING TOTAL 7,898.23 6,932.29 7,586.40 1,463.24 8,357.50
LARSON - BOYS BASKETBALL
12 Spalding Top Flight 1000 basketballs 34.89 418.68 28.20 338.40 34.25 411.00 Spalding 30.06 360.72 |sub TAG Franchise TBL-130 22.00 264.00
2 Ball Carts (Wolverine "Deluxe Mini Caddie BCO39M-4) 95.00 190.00 #CBRC4 64.50 129.00 Martin BC16 63.00 126.00 MCCR712W 22.42 44.84 NO BID
LARSON - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL 608.68 467.40 537.00 405.56 264.00
LARSON - GIRLS BASKETBALL
12 28.5 Spaulding TF 1000 Wide Channel Basketballs. 34.89 418.68 28.20 338.40 34.25 411.00 Spalding 30.06 360.72 |sub TAG Franchise TBL-135 22.00 264.00
1 16 Ball capacity Ball Cart 85.00 85.00 #CBRC4 64.50 64.50 41.50 4150 24.56 24.56 46.50 46.50
1 Hand Air Pump 7.00 7.00 4.50 4.50 3.00 3.00 2-way pump alt 1099997 2.04 2.04 5.00 5.00
20 Navy/White reversible practice jerseys plain 9.08 181.60 #TW1424 9.85 197.00 Alleson 540RW 8.75 175.00 Pro-Down 8.94 178.80 |No print 9.75 195.00
20 Navy Nylon practice shorts plain 8.99 179.80 #TW4423 9.75 195.00 570P 7.00 140.00 Pro-Down 8.76 175.20 [yule mesh 9.50 190.00
LARSON - GIRLS BASKETBALL TOTAL 872.08 799.40 770.50 741.32 700.50
BOULAN PARK - GIRLS BASKETBALL
10 28.5 Spaulding TF 1000 Wide Channel baskethalls 34.89 348.90 28.20 282.00 34.25 342.50 Spalding 30.06 |sub TAG Franchise TBL-135 22.00 220.00
BOULAN PARK - GIRLS BASKETBALL TOTAL 348.90 282.00 342.50 30.06 220.00
BOULAN PARK - VOLLEYBALL
10 Tachikara SV5W Gold Game Volleyballs 48.95 489.50 35.40 354.00 37.00 370.00 Tachifara 37.97 379.70 38.00 380.00
2 Mikasa collapsible hammock ball cart - purple 175.00 350.00 #BCH 82.80 165.60 90.00 180.00 NO BID 105.00 210.00
4 Volleyball Pal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Troy School District
BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

CO.: Park Athletic Supply
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Dimmer Warren
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.:Nabozneys
TERMS:

CO.: BSN Sports
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Tri County Custom Sports
TERMS: Net 30

FIRM: 6 Months FIRM: 60 Days FIRM: 180 Days FIRM: 3654 on all orders 05-28004 UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 60 Days except where noted
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL PRICE COST UNIT TOTAL
QTY DESCRIPTION Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST
1 skkymeter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BOULAN PARK - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 839.50 519.60 550.00 379.70 590.00
SMITH - BOYS BASKETBALL

6 28.5 Spaulding TF1000 Leather basketballs 34.89 209.34 28.20 169.20 34.25 205.50 Spalding 30.06 180.36 |Sub TAG Franchise 22.00 132.00
SMITH - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL 209.34 169.20 205.50 180.36 132.00

SMITH - VOLLEYBALL
4 Tachikara SV5W Gold Game Volleyballs 48.95 195.80 35.40 141.60 37.00 148.00 Tachikara 37.96 151.84 38.50 154.00
SMITH - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 195.80 141.60 148.00 151.84 154.00

BAKER - VOLLEYBALL
1 Volleyball equipment carrier 42" x 32" heavy duty. Holds up to four AAL 408 057 875.00 875.00 [#TC300 = $270.00 #EC500 295.00 295.00 Blazer 395.00 395.00 Alt STPVCA47 McGregor 267.82 267.82 |STPVCART 329.00 329.00

standards with nets, pads and antennae.

10 Tachikara SV5WS Volleyballs 32.95 329.50 22.50 225.00 25.00 250.00 Tachikara 24.24 242.40 |Sub TAG Leather NFHS Ball 27.00 270.00
3 Tachikara SV5W Gold Game Volleyballs 48.95 146.85 35.40 106.20 37.00 111.00 Tachikara 37.96 113.88 38.50 115.50
1 Antennae and tape for 36" net 89.95 89.95 68.50 68.50 NO BID McGregor 18.42 18.42 48.00 48.00
BAKER - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 1,441.30 694.70 756.00 642.52 762.50

LARSON - FOOTBALL
2 2" Orange Rubber kick off tee 4.00 8.00 2.70 5.40 2.10 4.20 Pro-Down 124 248 3.50 7.00
1 |pkg |1" Shoulder pad T hook 100/pkg AS| 24.00 24.00 18.00 18.00 45.00 45.00 Pro-Down 19.00 19.00 21.00 21.00
1 1-1/2" Shoulder pad T hook 100/pkg AS| 29.00 29.00 23.50 23.50 47.00 47.00 Pro-Down 20.00 20.00 27.00 217.00
24 3/4" Universal jaw pads, firm air 24ea-1dzpr 28.00 28.00 per pair 2.35 56.40 24 sets 2.50 60.00 NO BID 375 90.00
12 Assorted Back Sizers (1/2", 3/4" 1") air 4.95 59.40 6.70 80.40 4.50 54.00 NO BID 5.50 66.00
12 3/4" Front Sizers air 5.95 71.40 6.70 80.40 5.50 66.00 NO BID 8.50 102.00
25 \White web belts 1.25 31.25 0.80 20.00 0.80 20.00 Pro-Down 0.67 16.75 0.95 23.75
20 White pants (10 Small, 10 Medium) practice 11.89 237.80 8.85 177.00 Russell 9.00 180.00 Pro-Down 12.62 252.40 10.50 210.00
1 Adj. Lne splits marker 99.00 99.00 78.50 78.50 NO BID Pro-Down 4413 4413 105.00 105.00
1 Ball Bag - Blue 24.89 24.89 |XL mesh with draw cord & ID tag 6.75 6.75 7.00 7.00 32'x36" mesh 1.62 1.62 [TAG Equip Bag 20.00 20.00
3 14" x 50" Round Blocking Dummy ASI SDR 50 97.89 293.67 78.50 235.50 Fisher 89.00 267.00 Pro-Down Blue 53.96 161.88 83.00 249.00
4 Wilson TDY Youth Football (NO SUBSTITUTION) 34.89 139.56 27.40 109.60 18.00 72.00 3F1300 34.99 139.96 32.00 128.00
LARSON - FOOTBALL TOTAL 1,045.97 891.45 822.20 658.22 1,048.75

ATHENS - FOOTBALL
70 Riddell #16 USC Jersey (see attachment for specifications, numbers NO BID NO BID Rawlings Pacjusc 43.00 3,010.00 NO BID Sub COHN 55.90 3,913.00

and sizing) 1500/USC
ATHENS - FOOTBALL TOTAL NO BID NO BID 3,010.00 NO BID 3,913.00
Extra large vinyl with carring straps would be $26.50 Need jersey order A.S.A.P. to receive for 2005 season

Service Sports - No Response D C Athletic Inc. - No Bid 23,154.79 and heavy duty zipper 22,324.34 28,946.70 7,631.83 28,501.75

Dollamur Sports Services - No Bid Team Store - No Response

Hoyle Athletic Supply - No Response




Troy School District

CO.: Anthem Sports, LLC

CO.: Bill Fritz Sports Corp

CO.: Wolverine Sports (Div of School-Tech)

CO.: Golden Eagle Sports/All American

CO.: Sportmaster

BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT TERMS: Net 30 TERMS: N-30 TERMS: Net 30 TERMS: 30 Days TERMS: Net 30 Days
FIRM: Through 12-31-05 FIRM: 90 Days FIRM: 60 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 240 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL  (Bid #050204 PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST
QTY DESCRIPTION Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # ltem#  Alternate/ltem # ltem# Alternate/ltem #
ATHENS - BOYS BASKETBALL
12 Spaulding TF 1000 Basketballs 26.85 322.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Pearless Whistles with lanyard NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Slipp Nott refill pads 44.50 89.00 SNR 42.00 84.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 Jump Ropes NO BID SJR10 1.70 20.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 Red/White practice jerseys NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 Nets Anti-whip heavy duty 275 33.00 BKHDNET 4.00 48.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Tri-pod NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 Speedline Collegiate 0182-31 White Jersey with Scarlet trim and NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
lettering; "ATHENS" on front with number. Back will have 8" number.
Sizes & #'s: 5 size 44 - #'s 10,12,14,20,22;
8 size 46 - #'s 24,30,32,34,40,44,53:
2 size 48 - #'s 50,52; and 1 size 50 - #54
16 Collegiate 0577J-31 White short w/Red leg insert & #. 4-34's, 6-36's NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
and 2-40's
ATHENS - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL 444.20 152.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ATHENS - WRESTLING
20 E-41 Traditional Head Gear - Scarlet NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.00 360.00 NO BID
2 KBMR5 Replacement pads for bucketless mop (5 per package) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 SB-7 Cliff Keen Scorebook NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.00 15.00 NO BID
12 PL-1950 Life line power jump ropes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 L74CC86J Keen Sheen Lycra Singlet. Vegas Gold w/leg top & NO BID NO BID NO BID 57.00 1,710.00 NO BID
bottom trim in Red, leg middle trim in black. Arm & Neck trim in Red.
1-1/2" "TROY" with "ATHENS" below screened in Old English style
on center front in Red with Black outline. 1/2" "RED" with "HAWKS"
below screened in Old English style on Upper Back in Red with Black
outline. Sizes: 4-Small, 12-Medium, 7-Lg, 4-XL, 2-XXL, 1-XXXL
ATHENS - WRESTLING TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,085.00 NO BID
ATHENS - VOLLEYBALL
6 Wilson Gold AVP Leather - outdoor volleyballs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Park & Sun Spectrum Flex Set (TS-FLEX) outdoor net system NO BID TPFLER 167.00 334.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 Kaepa Spectrum tear away sweat pants - Red; Sizes: 6 med, 10-Lg NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 Asics Damsel warm-up sweat pants - Red; Sizes 3 small, 3 medium, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 large
16 Asics Chico duffle bag - Red NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 |sets |Volleyball Antennas 54.60 109.20 VANTEND 3.00 6.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Net Extender - USAV Training Device NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Skymeter - vertical jump marker NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 |box |Sport-X spot markers NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Videos - (1) Drills For Defense & Passing (By Russ Ross (2) Essential NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Troy School District

CO.: Anthem Sports, LLC

CO.: Bill Fritz Sports Corp

CO.: Wolverine Sports (Div of School-Tech)

CO.: Golden Eagle Sports/All American

CO.: Sportmaster

BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT TERMS: Net 30 TERMS: N-30 TERMS: Net 30 TERMS: 30 Days TERMS: Net 30 Days
FIRM: Through 12-31-05 FIRM: 90 Days FIRM: 60 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 240 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL  (Bid #050204 PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST
QTY DESCRIPTION Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # ltem#  Alternate/ltem # ltem# Alternate/ltem #
Drills For Blocking (By Debbie Brown)
ATHENS - VOLLEYBALL CONTINUED
1 Digital Scout Softwear NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ATHENS - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 109.20 340.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - VOLLEYBALL
14 Black Mizuno Training Jacket with TROY" embroidered in white on NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
left front. Sizes: 3 Small, 8 med, 3 Lg
14 Black Mizuno Training Pants with TROY" embroidered in white on front NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
left thigh. Sizes: 6 Med, 4 Lg, 4 Xtr Long Lg
17 National Il White/Black Mizuno Jersey 4" # on front left chest, 3" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Screened "TROY" on back with 8" # below. Sizes & Numbers:
6 Small (#'s 1-6), 9 Med. #s 7-14 (with 2 #12's), 2 Lg # 15 & 16
1 National Il Black/White Mizuno Jersey to match existing. 4" white #1¢ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
screened on left chest. 3" "TROY" on back with 8" #16 below.
Size: Medium
6 Mizuno Style 360010 Black Carry All Duffle NEO size: 26"Lx13"Wx NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13"H
15 Baden 15-OC red, black, white practice balls NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 Tachikara SV5W Gold game volleyballs 36.85 294.80 SV5W GOLD 35.60 284.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Ball Cart Champion 71.50 71.50 BIK-SP 91.00 91.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 372.30 375.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - BOYS BASKETBALL
2 |pkgs |KBA Black dry erase pens K-450 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 |pkgs |KBA Black dry erase pens K-451 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Coach double Folders (CDF-1) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Mark V scorebooks 3.85 11.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 Spalding Top Flite Mens Wide Channel Basketballs 26.85 322.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Super Wide Track Ball Rack (Korney 2000) 114.85 114.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 Russell M30 Shooting Shirt - White with silver/gray side/undersleeve NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
panel and neck and black piping stripe neck and braid bordering.
2 color screened interlocking TC on front center Black Sizes: 6 Ig, 9 XL
15 Russell M30 Tearway pant - White with silver/gray side panel and NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
black braid bordering. Sizes: 6 large, 9 XL
2 Blocking Shields 38.60 71.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 Black/White reversible scrimmage jerseys with numbers 1-15 screened NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
on both backs
15 Black scrimmage shorts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL 525.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - GYMNASTICS
1 Chalk Holder (AAI #407012) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 257.00 257.00
4 Hook & Jaw Turnbuckles (AAI 420735) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 65.00 260.00
1 Snap Lock for AMF/AAI (AAI 9700050) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.00 39.00




Troy School District

CO.: Anthem Sports, LLC

CO.: Bill Fritz Sports Corp

CO.: Wolverine Sports (Div of School-Tech)

CO.: Golden Eagle Sports/All American

CO.: Sportmaster

BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT TERMS: Net 30 TERMS: N-30 TERMS: Net 30 TERMS: 30 Days TERMS: Net 30 Days
FIRM: Through 12-31-05 FIRM: 90 Days FIRM: 60 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 240 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL  (Bid #050204 PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST
QTY DESCRIPTION Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # ltem#  Alternate/ltem # ltem# Alternate/ltem #
10 |lbs  |Chalk NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - GYMNASTICS CONTINUED
18 Black gymnastic bag with white trim NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - GYMNASTICS TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 556.00
TROY HIGH WRESTLING
40 Knee pads - sizes: 8 small, 12 med, 12 Ig, 8 X-Lg, (not black inside) NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.00 600.00 NO BID
12 Quad Tech Brute ear guard black with grey NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.00 144.00 NO BID
72 Brute 012345 Viper Singlet (see attached for specifications) 1 XS, 11 NO BID NO BID NO BID 55.00 3,960.00 NO BID
small, 23 med, 231g, 10 XL, 3 XXL 1 XXXL
2 |cases |4" Mat Tape 23/case NO BID NO BID NO BID 130.00 260.00 NO BID
6 MT3 Mat Transporter 21.5" x 26" to handle mat sections up to 14' wide NO BID NO BID NO BID 105.00 630.00 NO BID
1 Face Mask NO BID NO BID NO BID 44.00 44.00 NO BID
6 [sets |Ankle bands (green and red) NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.00 42.00 NO BID
2 KBM Kennedy bucketless mops NO BID NO BID NO BID 199.00 398.00 179.00 358.00
2 |pkgs |KBMR5 Replacement pads (pkg) NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00 50.00 63.00 126.00
1 K72 6' The Monster Mop NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 269.00 269.00
36 Holloway Flagship Jacket Black/Scarlet White lettering TC Wrestling on 48.80 1,756.80 NO BID NO BID 48.00 1,728.00 NO BID
front, Troy on back. Sizes and #'s 6 small (#1-6), 12 med (#7-18),
12 large (#19-30), 6XL (#30-35)
36 Holloway Jogger Pant Black 2175 783.00 NO BID NO BID 30.00 1,080.00 NO BID
TROY HIGH - WRESTLING TOTAL 2,539.80 NO BID NO BID 8,936.00 753.00
LARSON - BOYS BASKETBALL
12 Spalding Top Flight 1000 basketballs 26.45 317.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Ball Carts (Wolverine "Deluxe Mini Caddie BCO39M-4) NO BID C039M 1,400.00 2,800.00 124.46 248.92 NO BID NO BID
LARSON - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL 317.40 2,800.00 248.92 NO BID NO BID
LARSON - GIRLS BASKETBALL
12 28.5 Spaulding TF 1000 Wide Channel Basketballs. 26.45 317.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 16 Ball capacity Ball Cart 44.55 44.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Hand Air Pump NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 Navy/White reversible practice jerseys NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 Navy Nylon practice shorts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LARSON - GIRLS BASKETBALL TOTAL 361.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BOULAN PARK - GIRLS BASKETBALL
10 28.5 Spaulding TF 1000 Wide Channel baskethalls 26.45 264.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BOULAN PARK - GIRLS BASKETBALL TOTAL 264.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BOULAN PARK - VOLLEYBALL
10 Tachikara SV5W Gold Game Volleyballs 36.85 368.50 SV5WGOLD 35.10 351.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Mikasa collapsible hammock ball cart - purple NO BID 91.00 182.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Volleyball Pal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Troy School District

CO.: Anthem Sports, LLC

CO.: Bill Fritz Sports Corp

CO.: Wolverine Sports (Div of School-Tech)

CO.: Golden Eagle Sports/All American

CO.: Sportmaster

BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT TERMS: Net 30 TERMS: N-30 TERMS: Net 30 TERMS: 30 Days TERMS: Net 30 Days
FIRM: Through 12-31-05 FIRM: 90 Days FIRM: 60 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 240 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL  (Bid #050204 PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST
QTY DESCRIPTION Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # PRICE COST Item # Alternate/ltem # ltem#  Alternate/ltem # ltem# Alternate/ltem #
1 skkymeter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BOULAN PARK - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 368.50 533.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SMITH - BOYS BASKETBALL

6 28.5 Spaulding TF1000 Leather basketballs 26.45 158.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SMITH - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL 158.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SMITH - VOLLEYBALL
4 Tachikara SV5W Gold Game Volleyballs 36.85 147.40 SV5WGOLD 37.80 151.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SMITH - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 147.40 151.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BAKER - VOLLEYBALL
1 Volleyball equipment carrier 42" x 32" heavy duty. Holds up to four 242.00 242.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

standards with nets, pads and antennae.

10 Tachikara SV5WS Volleyballs 24.85 248.50 SV5W 24.70 247.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Tachikara SV5W Gold Game Volleyballs 36.85 110.55 SV5WGOLD 38.00 114.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Antennae and tape for 36" net 54.60 54.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BAKER - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 655.65 361.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

LARSON - FOOTBALL
2 2" Orange Rubber kick off tee NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 |pkg |1" Shoulder pad T hook 100/pkg NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 1-1/2" Shoulder pad T hook 100/pkg NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 3/4" Universal jaw pads, firm air NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 Assorted Back Sizers (1/2", 3/4" 1") air NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 3/4" Front Sizers air NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 White web belts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 White pants (10 Small, 10 Medium) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Adj. Lne splits marker 79.45 79.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Ball Bag - Blue mesh 15" x 36" 17.50 17.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 14" x 50" Round Blocking Dummy NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Wilson TDY Youth Football (NO SUBSTITUTION) 28.65 114.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LARSON - FOOTBALL TOTAL 211.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ATHENS - FOOTBALL
70 Riddell #16 USC Jersey (see attachment for specifications, numbers NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

and sizing)

ATHENS - FOOTBALL TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Service Sports - No Response D C Athletic Inc. - No Bid 6,476.95 4,713.40 248.92 11,021.00 1,309.00

Dollamur Sports Services - No Bid

Team Store - No Response  Hoyle Ath




Troy School District
BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

CO.: American Athletic, Inc.
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.: Pyramid School Products
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Dee's Sport Shop Inc.
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Korney Board Aids, Inc.
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.: Riddell/All American
TERMS: 1/10 N/30

FIRM: 30 Days UNIT TOTAL | FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 2005 UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 UNIT TOTAL
PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COSsT
QTY DESCRIPTION Item# Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # ltem#  Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem #
ATHENS - BOYS BASKETBALL
12 Spaulding TF 1000 Basketballs NO BID 30.99 371.88 21.25 327.00 35.00 420.00 NO BID
3 Pearless Whistles with lanyard NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.75 17.25 NO BID
2 Slipp Nott refill pads NO BID NO BID NO BID 45.00 90.00 NO BID
12 Jump Ropes NO BID NO BID NO BID Sold in pairs 15.00 180.00 NO BID
15 Red/White practice jerseys NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1424 13.25 198.75
12 Nets NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Tri-pod NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 Speedline Collegiate 0182-31 White Jersey with Scarlet trim and NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Any Style 106.00 1,696.00
lettering; "ATHENS" on front with number. Back will have 8" number.
Sizes & #'s: 5 size 44 - #'s 10,12,14,20,22;
8 size 46 - #'s 24,30,32,34,40,44,53:
2 size 48 - #'s 50,52; and 1 size 50 - #54
16 Collegiate 0577J-31 White short w/Red leg insert & #. 4-34's, 6-36's NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Free shooting shirt or -0-
and 2-40's practice jersey w/purchase
ATHENS - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL NO BID 371.88 327.00 707.25 1,894.75
ATHENS - WRESTLING
20 E-41 Traditional Head Gear - Scarlet NO BID 13.99 279.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 KBMR5 Replacement pads for bucketless mop (5 per package) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 SB-7 Cliff Keen Scorebook NO BID 4.99 14.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 PL-1950 Life line power jump ropes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 L74CC86J Keen Sheen Lycra Singlet. Vegas Gold w/leg top & NO BID 38.95 1,168.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
bottom trim in Red, leg middle trim in black. Arm & Neck trim in Red.
1-1/2" "TROY" with "ATHENS" below screened in Old English style
on center front in Red with Black outline. 1/2" "RED" with "HAWKS"
below screened in Old English style on Upper Back in Red with Black
outline. Sizes: 4-Small, 12-Medium, 7-Lg, 4-XL, 2-XXL, 1-XXXL
ATHENS - WRESTLING TOTAL NO BID 1,463.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ATHENS - VOLLEYBALL
6 Wilson Gold AVP Leather - outdoor volleyballs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Park & Sun Spectrum Flex Set (TS-FLEX) outdoor net system NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 Kaepa Spectrum tear away sweat pants - Red; Sizes: 6 med, 10-Lg NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 Asics Damsel warm-up sweat pants - Red; Sizes 3 small, 3 medium, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 large
16 Asics Chico duffle bag - Red NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 [sets |Volleyball Antennas AAI 40B045 130.00 260.00 NO BID NO BID TS Antenna 89.95 179.90 NO BID
1 Net Extender - USAV Training Device NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.95 23.95 NO BID
1 Skymeter - vertical jump marker NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 [box |Sport-X spot markers NO BID NO BID NO BID 34.95 34.95 NO BID
2 Videos - (1) Drills For Defense & Passing (By Russ Ross (2) Essential NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Troy School District
BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

CO.: American Athletic, Inc.
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.: Pyramid School Products

TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Dee's Sport Shop Inc.
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Korney Board Aids, Inc.
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.: Riddell/All American
TERMS: 1/10 N/30

FIRM: 30 Days UNIT TOTAL | FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 2005 UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 UNIT TOTAL
PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COSsT
QTY DESCRIPTION Item# Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # ltem#  Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem #
Drills For Blocking (By Debbie Brown)
ATHENS - VOLLEYBALL CONTINUED
1 Digital Scout Softwear NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ATHENS - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 260.00 NO BID NO BID 238.80 NO BID
TROY HIGH - VOLLEYBALL
14 Black Mizuno Training Jacket with TROY" embroidered in white on NO BID NO BID 30.00 420.00 NO BID NO BID
left front. Sizes: 3 Small, 8 med, 3 Lg
14 Black Mizuno Training Pants with TROY" embroidered in white on front NO BID NO BID 28.00 392.00 NO BID NO BID
left thigh. Sizes: 6 Med, 4 Lg, 4 Xtr Long Lg
17 National Il White/Black Mizuno Jersey 4" # on front left chest, 3" NO BID NO BID 30.00 510.00 NO BID NO BID
Screened "TROY" on back with 8" # below. Sizes & Numbers:
6 Small (#'s 1-6), 9 Med. #'s 7-14 (with 2 #12's), 2 Lg # 15 & 16
1 National Il Black/White Mizuno Jersey to match existing. 4" white #1¢ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
screened on left chest. 3" "TROY" on back with 8" #16 below.
Size: Medium
6 Mizuno Style 360010 Black Carry All Duffle NEO size: 26"Lx13"Wx NO BID NO BID 30.00 180.00 NO BID NO BID
13"H
15 Baden 15-OC red, black, white practice balls NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 Tachikara SV5W Gold game volleyballs NO BID NO BID NO BID 42.50 340.00 36.90 295.20
1 Ball Cart NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL NO BID NO BID 1,502.00 340.00 295.20
TROY HIGH - BOYS BASKETBALL
2 [pkgs |KBA Black dry erase pens K-450 NO BID 7.99 15.98 NO BID 6.00 12.00 NO BID
2 |pkgs |KBA Black dry erase pens K-451 NO BID 7.99 15.98 NO BID 8.00 16.00 NO BID
3 Coach double Folders (CDF-1) NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.95 65.85 NO BID
3 Mark V scorebooks NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.50 25.50 NO BID
12 Spalding Top Flite Mens Wide Channel Basketballs NO BID 30.99 371.88 21.25 327.00 35.00 420.00 NO BID
1 Super Wide Track Ball Rack (Korney 2000) NO BID NO BID NO BID 135.00 135.00 NO BID
15 Russell M30 Shooting Shirt - White with silver/gray side/undersleeve NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
panel and neck and black piping stripe neck and braid bordering.
2 color screened interlocking TC on front center Black Sizes: 6 Ig, 9 XL
15 Russell M30 Tearway pant - White with silver/gray side panel and NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
black braid bordering. Sizes: 6 large, 9 XL
2 Blocking Shields NO BID NO BID NO BID 60.00 120.00 V16 29.00 58.00
15 Black/White reversible scrimmage jerseys with numbers 1-15 screened NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1424 17.15 257.25
on both backs
15 Black scrimmage shorts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID WSMPC 7.90 118.50
TROY HIGH - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL NO BID 403.84 327.00 794.35 433.75
TROY HIGH - GYMNASTICS
1 Chalk Holder (AAI #407012) 170.00 170.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Hook & Jaw Turnbuckles (AAI 420735) 45.00 180.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Snap Lock for AMF/AAI (AAI 9700050) 20.00 20.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Troy School District
BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

CO.: American Athletic, Inc.
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.: Pyramid School Products
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Dee's Sport Shop Inc.

TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Korney Board Aids, Inc.
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.: Riddell/All American
TERMS: 1/10 N/30

FIRM: 30 Days UNIT TOTAL | FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 2005 UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 UNIT TOTAL
PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COSsT
QTY DESCRIPTION Item# Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # ltem#  Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem #
10 |lbs  |Chalk AAI 407550 8.10 81.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - GYMNASTICS CONTINUED
18 Black gymnastic bag with white trim NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - GYMNASTICS TOTAL 451.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH WRESTLING
40 Knee pads - sizes: 8 small, 12 med, 12 Ig, 8 X-Lg, (not black inside) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 Quad Tech Brute ear guard black with grey NO BID 13.99 167.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID
72 Brute 012345 Viper Singlet (see attached for specifications) 1 XS, 11 NO BID 53.95 3,884.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
small, 23 med, 231g, 10 XL, 3 XXL 1 XXXL
2 |cases |4" Mat Tape 23/case NO BID |Champion 4x28 110.16 220.32 NO BID NO BID ASMT4 142.80 285.60
6 MT3 Mat Transporter 21.5" x 26" to handle mat sections up to 14' wide NO BID 89.95 539.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Face Mask NO BID |Cliff Keen #F63 42.95 42.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 |sets |Ankle bands (green and red) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 KBM Kennedy bucketless mops NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 |pkgs |KBMR5 Replacement pads (pkg) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 K72 6' The Monster Mop NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 Holloway Flagship Jacket Black/Scarlet White lettering TC Wrestling on NO BID NO BID 33.50 1,206.00 NO BID NO BID
front, Troy on back. Sizes and #'s 6 small (#1-6), 12 med (#7-18),
12 large (#19-30), 6XL (#30-35)
36 Holloway Jogger Pant Black NO BID NO BID Holloway 9021 18.75 675.00 NO BID NO BID
TROY HIGH - WRESTLING TOTAL NO BID 4,855.25 1,881.00 NO BID 285.60
LARSON - BOYS BASKETBALL
12 Spalding Top Flight 1000 basketballs NO BID 30.95 371.40 21.25 327.00 35.00 420.00 NO BID
2 Ball Carts (Wolverine "Deluxe Mini Caddie BCO39M-4) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LARSON - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL NO BID 371.40 327.00 420.00 NO BID
LARSON - GIRLS BASKETBALL
12 28.5 Spaulding TF 1000 Wide Channel Basketballs. NO BID 29.95 359.40 21.25 327.00 35.00 420.00 NO BID
1 16 Ball capacity Ball Cart NO BID Champion #BRC ~ 41.95 41.95 NO BID BBC-12 255.00 255.00 NO BID
1 Hand Air Pump NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 Navy/White reversible practice jerseys NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1442 13.09 261.80
20 Navy Nylon practice shorts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID WSMPC 7.90 158.00
LARSON - GIRLS BASKETBALL TOTAL NO BID 401.35 327.00 675.00 419.80
BOULAN PARK - GIRLS BASKETBALL
10 28.5 Spaulding TF 1000 Wide Channel baskethalls NO BID 29.95 299.50 21.25 272.50 35.00 350.00 NO BID
BOULAN PARK - GIRLS BASKETBALL TOTAL NO BID 299.50 272.50 350.00 NO BID
BOULAN PARK - VOLLEYBALL
10 Tachikara SV5W Gold Game Volleyballs NO BID NO BID NO BID 32.00 320.00 RVBTS 36.90 369.00
2 Mikasa collapsible hammock ball cart - purple NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Volleyball Pal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Troy School District
BID 9226 WINTER ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

CO.: American Athletic, Inc.
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.: Pyramid School Products
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Dee's Sport Shop Inc.
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Korney Board Aids, Inc.
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.: Riddell/All American
TERMS: 1/10 N/30

FIRM: 30 Days UNIT TOTAL | FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 Days UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 2005 UNIT TOTAL FIRM: 90 UNIT TOTAL
PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COSsT
QTY DESCRIPTION Item# Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # ltem#  Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem # Item # Alternate/ltem #
1 skkymeter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BOULAN PARK - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID 320.00 369.00
SMITH - BOYS BASKETBALL

6 28.5 Spaulding TF1000 Leather basketballs NO BID 29.95 179.70 21.25 163.50 36.00 216.00 NO BID
SMITH - BOYS BASKETBALL TOTAL NO BID 179.70 163.50 216.00 NO BID

SMITH - VOLLEYBALL
4 Tachikara SV5W Gold Game Volleyballs NO BID NO BID NO BID 44.95 179.80 RVBTS 36.90 147.60
SMITH - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID 179.80 147.60

BAKER - VOLLEYBALL
1 Volleyball equipment carrier 42" x 32" heavy duty. Holds up to four AAIl 408057 732.00 732.00 NO BID NO BID EC-500 300.00 300.00 NO BID

standards with nets, pads and antennae.

10 Tachikara SV5WS Volleyballs NO BID NO BID NO BID 32.00 320.00 NO BID
3 Tachikara SV5W Gold Game Volleyballs NO BID NO BID NO BID 44.95 134.85 RVBTS 36.90 110.70
1 Antennae and tape for 36" net AAIl 408045 130.00 130.00 NO BID NO BID 24.00 24.00 NO BID
BAKER - VOLLEYBALL TOTAL 862.00 NO BID NO BID 778.85 110.70

LARSON - FOOTBALL
2 2" Orange Rubber kick off tee NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 27541 1.90 3.80
1 |pkg |1" Shoulder pad T hook 100/pkg NO BID NO BID Adams SPH-1 0.40 0.40 NO BID 1208 27.00 27.00
1 1-1/2" Shoulder pad T hook 100/pkg NO BID NO BID Adams SPH-2 0.55 0.55 NO BID 1219 31.00 31.00
24 3/4" Universal jaw pads, firm air NO BID NO BID Adams VSP 3.25 78.00 NO BID 45727 1.48 35.52
12 Assorted Back Sizers (1/2", 3/4" 1") air NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 3/4" Front Sizers air NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 White web belts NO BID NO BID Adams 0.75 18.75 NO BID WB52 0.77 19.25
20 White pants (10 Small, 10 Medium) NO BID NO BID Adams UFD79 slotted 7.95 159.00 NO BID PPP 10.24 204.80
1 Adj. Lne splits marker NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID RFBLMARKER 79.00 79.00
1 Ball Bag - Blue NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 14" x 50" Round Blocking Dummy NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID V13 71.42 214.26
4 Wilson TDY Youth Football (NO SUBSTITUTION) NO BID NO BID 21.25 109.00 NO BID NO BID
LARSON - FOOTBALL TOTAL NO BID NO BID 365.70 NO BID 614.63

ATHENS - FOOTBALL Cardinal in color with Notre Dame Gold shoulder and side inserts. Cuffs and neck collar are to be 1/2"

70 Riddell #16 USC Jersey (see attachment for specifications, numbers NO BID NO BID Wilson F8350 48.00 3,360.00 NO BID |white and 1/2" Notre Dame Gold. Cloth is to be tricot, two color 12" numbers 58.10 4,067.00
and sizing) are to be on front and back (white outlined in N.D.  Handling Fee 18.00
Gold). 7" Sleeves with cuffs. Shipping 142.35
ATHENS - FOOTBALL TOTAL NO BID NO BID 3,360.00 NO BID 4,227.35
Service Sports - No Response D C Athletic Inc. - No Bid 1,573.00 8,346.19 8,852.70 5,020.05 8,798.38

Dollamur Sports Services - No Bid

Team Store - No Response  Hoyle Ath




