Troy School District
Athens Media Center Furnishings
Bid 9648
E-Quip Co. School Specialty SBD Commercial Int.
Qty Tag |Manufacturer Unit Price Total Alt Unit Price Total Alt Unit Price Total
7 A Jasper 453.00 3,171.00 | Paladin 542.14 3,794.98 [ HLF Furn 383.91 2,687.37
22 B |Jasper 372.00 8,184.00 | rPaladin 381.91 8,402.02 | HLFFurn 275.86 6,068.92
29 C Jasper incl - Paladin 18.29 530.41 | |HLF Furn 74.71 2,166.59
6 D Jasper 676.00 4,056.00 | Paladin 780.44 4,682.64 | HLFFurn 574.71 3,448.26
12 E  Jasper 571.00 6,852.00 | Paladin 539.43 6,473.16 | HLF Furn 436.78 5,241.36
18 F Jasper incl - Paladin 26.92 484.56 | HLFFurn 77.01 1,386.18
8 G Jasper 538.00 4,304.00 | Paladin 733.59 5,868.72 | HLF Furn 457.47 3,659.76
5 H  Jasper 453.00 2,265.00 [ |Paladin 584.87 2,924.35 [ HLF Furn 363.22 1,816.10
13 I Jasper incl - Paladin 20.23 262.99 | HLFFurn 55.17 717.21
2 J Jasper 630.00 1,260.00 | |Paladin 684.07 1,368.14 | |HLF Furn 572.41 1,144.82
2 K |Jasper 550.00 1,100.00 | |paladin 586.61 1,173.22 | |HLF Furn 478.16 956.32
4 L Jasper incl - Paladin 71.60 286.40 | HLFFurn 55.17 220.68
3 M  Jasper 510.00 1,530.00 | |paladin 684.07 2,052.21 [ HLF Furn 514.94 1,544.82
2 N |Jasper 425.00 850.00 | |Paladin 532.07 1,064.14 | |HLF Furn 420.69 841.38
5 O Jasper incl - Paladin 17.90 89.50 | HLFFurn 55.17 275.85
1 P |Jasper 371.00 371.00 | Paladin 576.43 576.43 | |HLF Furn 381.61 381.61
1 Q Jasper 327.00 327.00 | Paladin 257.76 257.76 | HLFFurn 321.84 321.84
2 R Jasper incl - Paladin 35.80 71.60 | HLFFurn 55.17 110.34
2 S |Jasper 289.00 578.00 | Paladin 356.43 712.86 | |HLF Furn 266.67 533.34
10 T |lasper 239.00 2,390.00 | |Paladin 257.76 2,577.60 [ HLF Furn 206.90 2,069.00
12 U |Jasper incl - Paladin 17.90 214.80 | HLFFurn 55.17 662.04
10 V  Jasper 356.00 3,560.00 | Paladin 516.28 5,162.80 [ HLF Furn 373.56 3,735.60
9 W Jasper 316.00 2,844.00 [ |Paladin 481.60 4,334.40 | HLFFurn 335.63 3,020.67
2 X  Jasper 413.00 826.00 | |Paladin 658.50 1,317.00 | |HLF Furn 626.44 1,252.88
73 Y  Community 139.00 10,147.00 | Paladin 134.63 9,827.99 126.11 9,206.03
39 Z |Community 168.00 6,552.00 | Paladin 158.01 6,162.39 153.53 5,987.67
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Troy School District
Athens Media Center Furnishings
Bid 9648
E-Quip Co. School Specialty SBD Commercial Int.
Qty Tag |Manufacturer Unit Price Total Alt Unit Price Total Alt Unit Price Total
2 AA  Jasper 504.00 1,008.00 | |paladin 785.95 1,571.90 | HLFFurn 568.97 1,137.94
10 BB Jasper 376.00 3,760.00 | Paladin 743.11 7,431.10 | HLFFurn 431.03 4,310.30
1 HH |Jasper 142.00 142.00 no bid HLF Furn incl -
1 00 Jasper 1,104.00 1,104.00 | |paladin 976.44 976.44 | HLF Furn 9,974.23 9,974.23
2 PP |Jasper 628.00 1,256.00 | |paladin 577.60 1,155.20 | HLFFurn incl -
1 QQ |Jasper 1,104.00 1,104.00 | Paladin 976.44 976.44 | |HLF Furn incl -
1 RR Jasper 680.00 680.00 | Paladin 650.95 650.95 | HLF Furn incl -
2 SS  Jasper 202.00 404.00 | |Paladin 306.93 613.86 | HLFFurn incl -
3 UU Jasper incl - Paladin 9.10 27.30 | HLFFurn incl -
1 VV Jasper 1,390.00 1,390.00 | Paladin 976.44 976.44 | |HLF Furn incl -
1 YY Jasper 162.00 162.00 | Paladin 142.11 142.11 | HLFFurn incl -
1 ZZ Jasper 162.00 162.00 | Paladin 142.11 142.11 | HLFFurn incl -
4 AAA Jasper no bid - not req'd HLF Furn incl -
2 CBA |Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn 932.16 1,864.32
6 CBB Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn 1,048.52 6,291.12
4 CBC Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn  incl -
8 CBD |Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn 684.00 5,472.00
16 CBE Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn  incl -
4 CBF |Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn 527.60 2,110.40
2 CBG Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn 969.70 1,939.40
4 CBH |Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn 419.16 1,676.64
4 CBI |Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn 602.67 2,410.68
6 CBJ |Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn 473.38 2,840.28
4 CBX Carolina Business Furn no bid - no bid - Legacy Furn 310.72 1,242.88
2 HA Hon no bid - Paladin 275.51 551.02 | 9to5 177.53 355.06
6 HB Hon no bid - Paladin 321.74 1,930.44 | |9to5 148.31 889.86
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Troy School District
Athens Media Center Furnishings
Bid 9648
E-Quip Co. School Specialty SBD Commercial Int.
Qty Tag |Manufacturer Unit Price Total Alt Unit Price Total Alt Unit Price Total
1 HC Hon 838.00 838.00 | Paladin 296.97 296.97 | HLFFurn 1,017.24 1,017.24
1 HC1 |Hon incl - Paladin 259.78 259.78 | HLFFurn incl -
4 HD Hon 353.00 1,412.00 | Paladin 223.56 894.24 | HLF Furn 281.61 1,126.44
Freight Incl Incl - incl
Installation 4460 Incl - incl
Total 79,049.00 89,269.37 104,115.43
ALTERNATE 1
1 CC Jasper 473.00 473.00 | |Paladin 504.79 504.79 | HLFFurn 214.29 214.29
3 CC1 Jasper 373.00 1,119.00 | Paladin 406.46 1,219.38 | HLFFurn 214.29 642.87
1 DD |Jasper 473.00 473.00 | |Paladin 504.79 504.79 | HLFFurn 214.29 214.29
4 DD1 |Jasper 373.00 1,492.00 | Paladin 406.46 1,625.84 | HLFFumn 214.29 857.16
1 EE Jasper 473.00 473.00 | |Paladin 504.79 504.79 | HLFFurn 214.29 214.29
3 EE1 Jasper 373.00 1,119.00 | Paladin 406.46 1,219.38 | HLFFurn 214.29 642.87
1 FF |Jasper 473.00 473.00 | |Paladin 504.79 504.79 | HLFFurn 214.29 214.29
10 FF1 Jasper 373.00 3,730.00 | paladin 406.46 4,064.60 | HLFFurn 214.29 2,142.90
1 GG |Jasper 473.00 473.00 | |Paladin 504.79 504.79 | HLFFurn 214.29 214.29
4 GG1 Jasper 373.00 1,492.00 | Paladin 406.46 1,625.84 | HLFFumn 214.29 857.16
ALT 1 Freight Incl 0 Incl - incl -
ALT 1 Installation 480 Incl - incl -
ALT 1 Total 11,797.00 12,278.99 6,214.41
BID GRAND TOTAL 90,846.00 101,548.36 110,329.84
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Troy School District
Athens Media Center Furnishings
Bid 9648
Dew-El Corp. ASG 3rd Coast
Qty Tag 'Manufacturer Alt. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
7 A Jasper Brodart 368.80 2,581.60 310.00 2,170.00 290.95 2,036.65
22 B Jasper Brodart 279.95 6,158.90 236.00 5,192.00 225.40 4,958.80
29 C Jasper Brodart 45.00 1,305.00 82.00 2,378.00 78.20 2,267.80
6 D Jasper Brodart 587.10 3,522.60 528.00 3,168.00 543.95 3,263.70
12 E Jasper Brodart 455.00 5,460.00 402.00 4,824.00 384.10 4,609.20
18 F Jasper Brodart 50.95 917.10 105.00 1,890.00 101.20 1,821.60
8 G  Jasper Brodart 493.40 3,947.20 629.00 5,032.00 455.40 3,643.20
5 H Jasper Brodart 493.40 2,467.00 505.00 2,525.00 331.20 1,656.00
13 I Jasper Brodart incl - 105.00 1,365.00 55.20 717.60
2 J Jasper Brodart 580.95 1,161.90 568.00 1,136.00 553.15 1,106.30
2 K Jasper Brodart 580.95 1,161.90 490.00 980.00 426.65 853.30
4 L Jasper Brodart incl - 57.00 228.00 55.20 220.80
3 M Jasper Brodart 458.43 1,375.29 466.00 1,398.00 455.40 1,366.20
2 N Jasper Brodart 458.43 916.86 389.00 778.00 331.20 662.40
5 O  Jasper Brodart incl - 57.00 285.00 55.20 276.00
1 P Jasper Brodart 485.85 485.85 367.00 367.00 438.15 438.15
1 Q Jasper Brodart 417.00 417.00 325.00 325.00 397.90 397.90
2 R Jasper Brodart 27.12 54.24 42.00 84.00 40.25 80.50
2 S Jasper Brodart 320.70 641.40 240.00 480.00 204.70 409.40
10 T Jasper Brodart 229.75 2,297.50 198.00 1,980.00 159.85 1,598.50
12 U Jasper Brodart 33.90 406.80 57.00 684.00 55.20 662.40
10 Vv Jasper Brodart 369.70 3,697.00 290.00 2,900.00 299.00 2,990.00
9 W  Jasper Brodart 323.50 2,911.50 241.00 2,169.00 290.95 2,618.55
2 X Jasper Brodart 1,082.60 2,165.20 585.00 1,170.00 568.10 1,136.20
73 Y  Community Jasper 132.50 9,672.50 137.00 10,001.00 137.92 10,068.16
39 VA Community Jasper 162.50 6,337.50 161.00 6,279.00 161.55 6,300.45

Page 4 of 9




Troy School District
Athens Media Center Furnishings
Bid 9648
Dew-El Corp. ASG 3rd Coast
Qty Tag 'Manufacturer Alt. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
2 AA |Jasper Brodart 527.15 1,054.30 319.00 638.00 546.25 1,092.50
10 BB Jasper Brodart 472.20 4,722.00 250.00 2,500.00 448.50 4,485.00
1 HH |Jasper Brodart 245.40 245.40 400.00 400.00 145.00 145.00
1 00 |Jasper Brodart 1,024.10 1,024.10 7,580.00 7,580.00 886.50 886.50
2 PP  Jasper Brodart 870.20 1,740.40 incl - 569.25 1,138.50
1 QQ |Jasper Brodart 1,116.85 1,116.85 incl - 1,208.65 1,208.65
1 RR Jasper Brodart 880.85 880.85 incl - 573.85 573.85
2 SS  |Jasper Brodart 397.85 795.70 incl - 151.80 303.60
3 UuU |Jasper Brodart incl - - 40.25 120.75
1 VWV |Jasper Brodart 1,023.50 1,023.50 - 1,208.65 1,208.65
1 YY |Jasper Brodart 137.95 137.95 - 184.00 184.00
1 ZZ Jasper Brodart 137.95 137.95 - 184.00 184.00
4 AAA Jasper Brodart incl - - 184.00 736.00
2 CBA |Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp 556.85 1,113.70 840.00 1,680.00 1,179.23 2,358.46
6 CBB Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp 1,310.30 7,861.80 1,070.00 6,420.00 1,647.17 9,883.02
4 CBC Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp | incl - 200.00 800.00 369.89 1,479.56
8 CBD |Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp 962.75 7,702.00 760.00 6,080.00 863.60 6,908.80
16 CBE Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp | incl - incl - 320.29 5,124.64
4 CBF |Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp 1,331.15 5,324.60 1,270.00 5,080.00 1,647.17 6,588.68
2 CBG Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp 1,322.10 2,644.20 1,005.00 2,010.00 1,716.67 3,433.34
4 CBH |Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp 680.00 2,720.00 490.00 1,960.00 625.44 2,501.76
4 CBI |Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp 385.75 1,543.00 995.00 3,980.00 1,474.80 5,899.20
6 CBJ |Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp 680.00 4,080.00 630.00 3,780.00 1,022.20 6,133.20
4 CBX Carolina Business Furn Office Furn Grp 406.85 1,627.40 490.00 1,960.00 427.82 1,711.28
2 HA Hon 296.35 592.70 290.00 580.00 291.02 582.04
6 HB Hon 345.25 2,071.50 340.00 2,040.00 335.94 2,015.64
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Troy School District
Athens Media Center Furnishings
Bid 9648
Dew-El Corp. ASG 3rd Coast
Qty Tag 'Manufacturer Alt. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 HC Hon 337.55 337.55 312.00 312.00 309.13 309.13
1 HC1 Hon 295.85 295.85 275.00 275.00 270.51 270.51
4 HD |Hon 254.00 1,016.00 235.00 940.00 232.79 931.16
- Perf bond 4,120.00
Freight incl - 1,100.00 incl -
Installation incl - 7,140.00 incl -
ﬁTotal 111,871.14 117,043.00 128,677.18
ALTERNATE 1 -
1 CC Jasper Brodart 451.50 451.50 265.00 265.00 454,25 454.25
3 CC1 Jasper Brodart 376.25 1,128.75 265.00 795.00 396.75 1,190.25
1 DD |Jasper Brodart 397.10 397.10 245.00 245.00 454,25 454.25
4 DD1 |Jasper Brodart 345.00 1,380.00 245.00 980.00 396.75 1,587.00
1 EE Jasper Brodart 451.50 451.50 162.00 162.00 488.75 488.75
3 EE1 Jasper Brodart 376.25 1,128.75 162.00 486.00 396.75 1,190.25
1 FF  |Jasper Brodart 451.50 451.50 162.00 162.00 488.75 488.75
10 FF1 Jasper Brodart 376.25 3,762.50 162.00 1,620.00 454,25 4,542.50
1 GG |Jasper Brodart 451.50 451.50 162.00 162.00 488.75 488.75
4 GG1 Jasper Brodart 376.25 1,505.00 162.00 648.00 454,25 1,817.00
ALT 1 Freight incl - 350.00
ALT 1 Installation incl - 1,100.00
ﬁALT 1 Total incl 11,108.10 6,975.00 12,701.75
BID GRAND TOTAL 122,979.24 124,018.00 141,378.93
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Troy School District
Athens Media Center Furnishings
Bid 9648
Office Express Lincoln Office Solutions
BID TO SPEC BID TO SPEC
Qty Tag 'Manufacturer Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
7 A |Jasper 420.00 2,940.00 489.34 3,425.38
22 B  Jasper 337.00 7,414.00 393.44 8,655.68
29 C |Jasper 66.00 1,914.00 77.70 2,253.30
6 D |Jasper 639.00 3,834.00 742.13 4,452.78
12 E |Jasper 562.00 6,744.00 655.08 7,860.96
18 F Jasper 67.00 1,206.00 78.20 1,407.60 Detroit Office Interiors: No Response
8 G Jasper 595.00 4,760.00 686.56 5,492.48 Facility Matrix Group: No Response
5 H Jasper 465.00 2,325.00 534.10 2,670.50 Global Office Solutions: No Response
13 I Jasper 45.00 585.00 52.13 677.69 Great Lakes Furn & Sply: No Response
2 J Jasper 725.00 1,450.00 820.82 1,641.64 ISCG: No Response
2 K Jasper 575.00 1,150.00 668.36 1,336.72 Kerr Albert: No Response
4 L Jasper 44.00 176.00 51.15 204.60 Office Depot: No Response
3 M Jasper 575.00 1,725.00 664.43 1,993.29 Staples: No Response
2 N  |Jasper 425.00 850.00 490.33 980.66
5 O |Jasper 44.00 220.00 51.15 255.75
1 P Jasper 650.00 650.00 771.64 771.64
1 Q Jasper 600.00 600.00 704.75 704.75
2 R Jasper 40.00 80.00 46.72 93.44
2 S  Jasper 325.00 650.00 367.87 735.74
10 T  |Jasper 275.00 2,750.00 300.98 3,009.80
12 U Jasper 44.00 528.00 51.15 613.80
10 VvV  Jasper 330.00 3,300.00 384.59 3,845.90
9 W Jasper 300.00 2,700.00 344.75 3,102.75
2 X |lasper 675.00 1,350.00 758.85 1,517.70
73 Y Community 107.00 7,811.00 114.10 8,329.30
39 z Community 129.00 5,031.00 134.64 5,250.96
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Troy School District
Athens Media Center Furnishings
Bid 9648
Office Express Lincoln Office Solutions
BID TO SPEC BID TO SPEC
Qty Tag 'Manufacturer Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
2 AA |Jasper 660.00 1,320.00 760.33 1,520.66
10 BB |Jasper 500.00 5,000.00 584.26 5,842.60
1 HH Jasper 5,500.00 5,500.00 not req'd -
1 00 Jasper 1,150.00 1,150.00 1,311.64 1,311.64
2 PP  Jasper 794.00 1,588.00 922.13 1,844.26
1 QQ |Jasper 1,150.00 1,150.00 2,311.97 2,311.97
1 RR Jasper 725.00 725.00 848.85 848.85
2 SS  |Jasper 220.00 440.00 257.21 514.42
3 UuU Jasper 31.00 93.00 35.90 107.70
1 VV  Jasper 1,150.00 1,150.00 1,311.64 1,311.64
1 YY |Jasper 175.00 175.00 205.08 205.08
1 ZZ Jasper 175.00 175.00 205.08 205.08
4 AAA |Jasper 175.00 700.00 209.02 836.08
2 CBA |Carolina Business Furn 1,050.00 2,100.00 1,139.18 2,278.36
6 CBB Carolina Business Furn 1,470.00 8,820.00 1,591.23 9,547.38
4 CBC Carolina Business Furn 330.00 1,320.00 357.33 1,429.32
8 CBD |Carolina Business Furn 770.00 6,160.00 834.27 6,674.16
16 CBE Carolina Business Furn 278.00 4,448.00 301.33 4,821.28
4 CBF |Carolina Business Furn 1,475.00 5,900.00 1,591.18 6,364.72
2 CBG Carolina Business Furn 1,535.00 3,070.00 1,658.37 3,316.74
4 CBH |Carolina Business Furn 825.00 3,300.00 604.20 2,416.80
4 CBI |Carolina Business Furn 1,300.00 5,200.00 1,424.73 5,698.92
6 CBJ |Carolina Business Furn 915.00 5,490.00 987.49 5,924.94
4 CBX Carolina Business Furn 500.00 2,000.00 413.29 1,653.16
2 HA Hon 240.00 480.00 284.26 568.52
6 HB Hon 280.00 1,680.00 331.97 1,991.82
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Troy School District

Athens Media Center Furnishings

Bid 9648

Office Express Lincoln Office Solutions
Qty Tag 'Manufacturer Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 HC Hon 275.00 275.00 306.39 306.39
1 HC1 Hon 225.00 225.00 268.03 268.03
4 HD Hon 195.00 780.00 230.66 922.64
Freight 2,700.00 2,863.38
- Installation 3,450.00 6,924.04
ﬁTotal 139,307.00 152,115.39
ALTERNATE 1
1 CC Jasper 450.00 450.00 574.43 574.43
3 CC1 Jasper 435.00 1,305.00 486.89 1,460.67
1 DD |Jasper 475.00 475.00 535.08 535.08
4 DD1 Jasper 450.00 1,800.00 467.21 1,868.84
1 EE Jasper 490.00 490.00 574.43 574.43
3 EE1 Jasper 450.00 1,350.00 486.89 1,460.67
1 FF  |Jasper 490.00 490.00 574.43 574.43
10 FF1 Jasper 450.00 4,500.00 486.89 4,868.90
1 GG |Jasper 490.00 490.00 574.43 574.43
4 GG1 Jasper 450.00 1,800.00 486.89 1,947.56
Electrical 2,350.82
ALT 1 Freight - 1,348.63
ALT 1 Installation 2,000.00 1,215.85
ﬁALT 1 Total 15,150.00 19,354.74
BID GRAND TOTAL 154,457.00 171,470.13
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